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Abengoa to supply structures for 
new transmission line in Lithuania  

 

 The company thereby contributes to the country’s best electricity 
interconnection with neighboring Poland.   

May 22, de 2017 – Abengoa (MCE: ABG/P:SM),  the international company that 
applies innovative technology solutions for sustainability in the energy and 
environment sectors, has been selected by Zilinskis ir Co; the infrastructure 
solutions company, to supply the required structures for the construction of a new 
330kV transmission line, 53 km in length which will interconnect Alytus and 
Kruonis, two cities located in southern Lithuania. The project is worth 23 M€.   

Abengoa will be responsible for the supply of approximately 3,700 tons of steel 
which is required to make the structures for the 330kV electricity line that will run   
from Alytus to Kruonis, and will interconnect the Kruonis hydroelectric power 
station, located in the Kaunas region, to the Alytus substation which is located in 
the province with the same name.  

This will be the second 330kV electricity line built in the country since its 
independence in 1990, and will play a decisive role in the interconnection between 
Lithuania and Poland. In addition, it will help to ensure a more secure electricity 
supply in the south of the country and respond to the growing demand for energy 
in this area.  

Abengoa has extensive experience in supplying structures for projects of all kinds 
worldwide. In the area of transmission and distribution alone, the company has 
been involved in supplying structures for over 27,000 km of transmission lines and 
distribution and more than 330 substations constructed in the last 15 years.   

About Abengoa 
 
Abengoa (MCE: ABG/P:SM) applies innovative technology solutions for 
sustainability in the energy and environment sectors, generating electricity from 
renewable resources, converting biomass into biofuels and producing drinking 
water from sea water (www.abengoa.com).  
 
 
 
 
 

http://www.abengoa.com/
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